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Make a calendar for 

2016; name each 
month and the day 

of the week 

 
Collect all the pillows 
you have and make 

towers; talk about them 
using words like taller 

and shorter 

 
Add food coloring to 

snow and paint with it; 
talk about the colors 

you are using 

 
Talk about winter 

animals (polar bear, 
penguin, fox, etc.) 

 
Tell a story about 
something that 

happened over the 
holidays 

 
 

Make fake snow 
with ½ cup of 

conditioner and  2 
cups of baking soda 

 
 

Go to your local library 
and check-out a book 

about Winter 
 

 
Go sledding; talk about 
where you should start 
and where you might 

land 

 
 

Have an indoor picnic; 
Talk about everything 
you will need for the 

picnic 

 
Cut up straws and make 
a necklace or bracelet; 
count the straws as you 
put them on the string 

 
Go ice skating as a 
family; talk about 
what you will wear 

 
Make snow ice cream. 

Go to 
www.moogcenter.org 

for language ideas 
 

 
 

Make a snowflake with 
glue and cotton balls 

 
 

Make an indoor 
‘sandbox’ with cream of 

wheat 

 
Make a paper 

snowman; talk about 
the shapes you will use 

   

 
 

Play with your cars 
in shaving cream; 
talk about what 

you are doing 

 
 

Make snow in a bottle 
with water, corn starch, 
and glitter; talk about 

each step 

 
 

Freeze paint in ice cube 
trays and then paint 

with the ice cubes; talk 
about what happens 

 
Draw a self-portrait; 

label the different parts 
of your face  

 
 

Cut up a bunch of white 
paper and have an 
indoor snow storm 

 
Lay out everyone’s 

coat; talk about 
how they are the 

same and how they 
are different 

 
 

Practice tracing letters 
on paper   

 
Go in your bedroom 
and label all of the 

furniture (bed, 
headboard, nightstand, 

dresser, etc.) 

 
 

Get dressed to go 
outside; label each 

clothing item 

 
Make hot chocolate and 

talk about each step 
 


